
 

Monday Tuesday Wednesday Thursday Friday 
1 
 
 
 

         NO SCHOOL!! 
                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                      

2 

 
 
     NO SCHOOL!! 
 
 
 

3 
 
 
 

     NO SCHOOL!! 
 
 
 

4 
 
 
 

     NO SCHOOL!! 
 

5 
               

 
NO SCHOOL!! 

 

8 
 
BREAKFAST:  Cinnamon rolls, 
cereal, fruit or juice, milk 
 
LUNCH: Oven baked chicken legs, 
mashed potatoes w/ gravy, steamed 
carrots, hot rolls, fruit, milk 
 

9 
 

BREAKFAST: Biscuits & gravy, 
cereal, fruit or juice, milk 
 
LUNCH: Beef soft tacos, salsa, 
lettuce & tomato, bag of Doritos, 
pinto beans, fruit, milk 

 

10 
 

BREAKFAST: Egg & cheese 
omelets w/ toast, cereal, juice or 
fruit, milk 
LUNCH: Spaghetti w/ meat sauce, 
steamed green beans, tossed salad 
w/ dressing, garlic bread sticks, 
fruit, milk 

11 
 
BREAKFAST: Blueberry muffins 
w/ yogurt, cereal, juice or fruit, 
milk     
LUNCH: Breaded chicken patty 
on bun, baked French fries, 
lettuce, pickles & tomato, fruit, 
milk 

12 
 
BREAKFAST: Sausage, & egg 
biscuits, cereal, juice or fruit, milk 
 
LUNCH: Pizza, tossed Romaine  
salad w/ dressing, steamed corn, 
fruit, milk 

15 
 
BREAKFAST: Cinnamon French 
toast, cereal, fruit or juice, milk 
 
LUNCH: Baked Corndogs, red 
pepper hummus w/ club crackers, 
steamed peas, fruit, milk 

16 
 
BREAKFAST:  Mini bagels w/ 
strawberry cream cheese, cereal, 
juice or fruit, milk 
LUNCH: Chicken fettuccine 
alfredo, tossed salad w/ dressing, 
garlic bread sticks, fruit, milk 

17 
 
BREAKFAST: Sausage & egg 
biscuits, cereal, juice or fruit, milk 
 
LUNCH: BBQ on bun,  baked 
potato wedges, cole slaw, fruit, 
milk 

18 
  
BREAKFAST: Apple strudel, 
cereal, juice or fruit, milk 
 
LUNCH: Chicken soft tacos, 
lettuce & tomato, nachos w/ 
cheese & salsa, pinto beans, fruit, 
milk 

19 
 
BREAKFAST: Whole grain donuts 
w/ yogurt, cereal, juice or fruit, 
milk 
LUNCH: Biscuits & gravy, egg & 
cheese omelets, baked hash 
browns, fruit, milk 

 

22 
 

BREAKFAST:  Mini Waffles w/ 
syrup, cereal, juice or fruit, milk     
 
LUNCH: Macaroni and cheese, 
popcorn chicken, steamed 
broccoli, fruit, milk 

23 
                           
BREAKFAST: Breakfast pizza 
bagels, cereal, juice or fruit, milk     
 
LUNCH: Oven roasted turkey, 
mashed potatoes w/ gravy, steamed 
green beans, hot rolls, fruit, milk 

24 
 
BREAKFAST: Blueberry muffins 
w/ yogurt, cereal, juice or fruit, 
milk 
LUNCH: Cheeseburger on bun, 
baked French fries, lettuce, 
pickles & tomato, fruit, milk 

25 
 
BREAKFAST: Biscuits & gravy, 
cereal, fruit or juice, milk 
 
LUNCH: Oven baked chicken, 
mashed potatoes w/ gravy, steamed 
carrots, hot rolls, fruit, milk 

26 
 
BREAKFAST: Egg & cheese 
omelets w/ toast, cereal, juice or 
fruit, milk 
LUNCH: Pizza, tossed Romaine 
salad w/ dressing, steamed corn, 
fruit, milk 

29 
 
BREAKFAST: Whole grain donuts 
w/ yogurt, cereal, juice or fruit, 
milk 
 
LUNCH: Pigs in a blanket, tossed 
salad w/ dressing, steamed green 
beans, fruit, milk 

30 
 
BREAKFAST: Biscuits & gravy, 
cereal, fruit or juice, milk 
 
LUNCH: Chef Salad w/ diced ham 
and cheese, toasted cheese 
sandwich, baked potato, fruit, milk 
 

 

 

  
 
 
 

“This Institution is an Equal 
Opportunity Provider” 

 

 


